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WES BRYAN 
Environment, Safety, Health & Quality Assurance Director 

Wes Bryan serves as the Environment, Safety, Health & Quality 
(ESH&Q) Director, for Savannah River Mission Completion, LLC, 
(SRMC), which is conducting operations at the Department of 
Energy’s (DOE) Savannah River Site (SRS) near Aiken, S.C. In this 
role, Mr. Bryan leads efforts to continue the site’s positive safety 
culture program and fosters ESH&Q programs that support field 
execution.  
 
Mr. Bryan has over 30 years of experience in project management, 
operations, maintenance, radiological controls, waste management, 
and emergency management, as well as extensive knowledge of all 
liquid waste facilities and processes. At multiple sites across the 
Department of Energy complex, he has served in numerous 
leadership roles including Radiological Control Manager, Operations 
Manager, Facility Manager, and Vice President and Plant Manager. 
 
In his most recent position as the President and Project Manager of 
Washington River Protection Solutions, he led the Tank Operations 
Contract focused on ongoing cleanup effort at DOE’s Hanford Site. 
This included overseeing the safe and efficient management, 
retrieval, and pretreatment of radioactive and chemical tank waste.  
 
Before joining WRPS, Mr. Bryan was the Director of the Defense 
Waste Processing Facility (DWPF) and Saltstone Facilities for 
Savannah River Remediation. In this role, he successfully led the 
planning, management, integration, operation, and maintenance of 
DWPF, Saltstone, and Glass Waste Storage Buildings in the 
completion of mission goals in a safe, compliant, and efficient 
manner. He also completed two previous tours of duty at SRS, 
beginning as a Radiological Control Inspector and progressing to 
increasing roles of responsibilities across many of the facilities at 
SRS. Mr. Bryan also completed a six-year assignment at the Waste 
Isolation Pilot Plan in Carlsbad, NM, as well as a two-year assignment 
at the Advanced Mixed Waste Treatment Plan in Idaho Falls, Idaho. 
 
Mr. Bryan resides in Graniteville, S.C., with his wife and daughter 
and has two boys living in Salt Lake City, UT. 
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